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Abstract 

According to EUROSTAT (2013), approximately 9 million hectares of EU land is constituted by customary 
common lands (pastures, grazing lands, forests). This means about 7% of the total Utilized Agricultural Area 
(UAA). This percentage rises to even 9-10% of the EU territory, if we account also coasts and forests. An 
example of extent and forms of collective management of forests is given in the latest global report on forest 
ownership (FAO UNECE 2020). Besides, in the last decades several examples of more contemporary 
commons have been flourishing all over Europe (CSAs, urban gardens, and closely related initiatives, mostly 
embracing agroecology). Common land governance offers a greener, more sustainable, and resilient 
alternative to intensive agricultural land tenure systems, which is why most collective lands across Europe are 
considered officially protected (e.g., under the Natura 2000 Framework). However, there is not even a single 
mention of the commons neither in the incoming CAP (2023-2027) nor in the EU Green Deal with its associated 
strategies (Biodiversity & Farm to Fork Strategies, Climate Law, etc.). We claim that this “invisible reality” of 
the commons cannot be ignored, especially in light of its new environmental ambitious targets. Both 
contemporary and customary commons can constitute a point of departure for the EU to develop socially 
inclusive instruments that are sensitive to ecology. We illustrate sustainable and resilient rural development 
on this basis by two case studies from Slovenia and Spain. 
 
Slovenian example of commons refers to collective management of pastures and forests on less productive 
sites. Voluntary, self-organized and peer-mediated local production bases on both, productive and non-
productive values and has specific form of democratic organization that characterizes rural tradition. However, 
their national jurisdiction framed into agricultural sector poorly recognizes local collective rules and there is no 
statistics for this type of management. Commoners are under-represented in decision-making which is not a 
surprise in any post-socialist country after decades of abolition. Common lands are characterized with general 
reluctance of landowners to enter organizations and slow revival of their type of governance. Roles of old and 
new commons for rural resilience are not acknowledged as potentials. Natura 2000 protects 37% of the 
Slovenian territory- while commons are absent in public discourse and a subject of tensions between rural 
income potentials from agriculture, tourism, and nature protection. 
 
The communal lands of northwest Iberian Peninsula ‒ “baldios” in Portugal and “Montes Veciñais en Man 
Común” (MVMC) in Galicia ‒ play a vital role in the economy of the communities. This function was lost during 
the twentieth century because the forestation of them and the decline of agriculture. The restoration of 
democratic regimes returned them to their original owner communities, now in decline, aged and disorganized. 
Communal lands occupy near 1 million ha, 400,000 in north Portugal and 600,000 in Galicia with high average 
areas (500 ha in Portugal and 200 ha in Galicia). They are owned by around 2900 communities in Galicia and 
1000 in north Portugal. The use is mainly forestry, but numerous reasons caused in a sub-utilization of their 
potential. Both Galician and Portuguese case show similarities and complementary benefits needing 
socioeconomic innovation to make better use of rural resilience. The commons and small-scale business 
initiatives could support the network of the local produce markets with attractive values, as well as contribute 
to the conservation of the biodiversity.  
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among the IASC members in the region and beyond to facilitate content-based exchange and cross-disciplinary 

networking on bringing together the commons scholarship and practice with policy. 
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